BIDTAB L-B(K19)-73-97

TABULATION OF BIDS

NOTE: IN CASE OF MATHEMATICAL ERROR, UNIT PRICE SHALL GOVERN
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PROJECT NO. L-B(K19)--73-97

LETTING: TUESDAY, OCTOBER 8, 2024
Bridge Replacement
IN SECTION 10 T88N, R34W
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* Graves Construction Co. Inc.
* 1810 340th St. Box 1417

* Spencer IA, 51301

*

*

*

*

* Dixon Construction Co.

* 1319 Hackberry St.

* Correctionville IA, 51016
*

* % % % * ¥

ITEM NO,
1

2

10
1
12
13

14

16

ITEM

Clearing and Grubbing

Excavation class 10, Roadway and Borrow

Excavation Class 13, Waste

Excavation Class 10 Channel

Granular Surface on Road Crushed Concrete

Removal of Existing Bridge
Granular Backfill, (Place Only)
Excavation, Class 20

Piles, Steel, HP 8x36

Piles, Steel, HP 10x57

Piling, Steel Sheet

Revetment Class E

Safety Closure

Traffic Control

Mobilization

Install 80' True North Stee! Bridge

** QUANTITIES

L33

i 0.09 Acre
k%

* 863 CY
** 88 CY
*%

> 803 CY
*%

** 85 TON
* 1 LS
** 257 CY
hd 975 CY
* 360 LF
** 810 LF
w* 2875 SF
** 434 TON
** 2 EACH
** 1 LS
wk

i 1 LS
** 1 LS
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:: UNITPRICE : AMOUNT

:: $ 16,000.00 $ 1,440.00
:: $ 22.00 $ 18,986.00
:: $ 22.00 $ 1,936.00
"$ 800 © §  6424.00
i: $ 75.00 $ 6,375.00
:: $ 31,250.00 $  31,250.00
" 2400 ©§ 616800
:: $ 23.00 $ 22,425.00
:: $ 50.00 $ 18,000.00
:: $ 51.00 $  41,310.00
*$ 2050 . § 58,037.50
:: $ 79.00 $ 34,286.00
:: $ 275.00 $ 550.00
'S 440000 C$ 440000
*$ 65000.00 . § 6500000
** $100,000.00 $ 100,000.00
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TOTAL $ 417,487.50

* *

UNIT PRICE

*

* $ 55,000.00
*

* % 10.00
*

*$ 8.00
*

*$ 10.00
*

*$ 7.00
*

* $ 35,000.00
*$ 16.50
*

*§ 30.00
*$ 48.00
*

*$ 72.00
*

*$ 14.00
*

“$ 60.00
*

*$  200.00
*

*$ 4,500.00
*

* $ 35,000.00
*

* $102,000.00
*

*

TOTAL

:VAMOUNT

495000
$ 8,630.00
$  704.00
$ 8,030.00
$  595.00
$

35,000.00

©

4,240.50
29,250.00

17,280.00

©®  ©

58,320.00
40,250.00
26,040.00

400.00

4,500.00
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35,000.00

$ 102,000.00

$ 375,189.50
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$52,777.78
$  17.00
$  10.00
$  10.00
$ 2500
$ 25,000.00
$  17.00
$ 2000
$  43.00
$  57.00
$  14.00
$ 5960
$  500.00
$ 7,000.00
$ 70,000.00
$70,000.00
TOTAL
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*UNIT PRICE : AMOUNT

5
$
$
s
$
$
5
$
$
s
$
$
5

$
$
$
$

4,750.00
14,671.00
880.00
8,030.00
2,125.00
25,000.00
4,369.00
19,500.00
15,480.00
46,170.00
40,250.00
25,866.40
1,000.00
7,000.00
70,000.00

70,000.00
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$ 355,091.40



Shona Campbell

From: Jacob Gilreath

Sent: Thursday, October 17, 2024 11:47 AM
To: Shona Campbell

Subject: RE: 2024-10-15 Board Items

Shona,

Dixon constructicn Company was awarded the L-B(K19)—73-97 Project.
Cedar Falls Construction was awarded the PCC Patching 2024 project.

Thank you,

Jacob Gilreath

Woodbury County Secondary Roads
759 E Frontage Rd, Moville, 1A 51039
Office: (712) 873-3215

Cell: (712) 898-5602

From: Shona Campbell <shcampbell@woodburycountyiowa.gov>
Sent: Thursday, October 17, 2024 10:40 AM

To: Jacob Gilreath <jgilreath@woodburycountyiowa.gov>
Subject: RE: 2024-10-15 Board ltems

Sorry, | meant 11¢ and 11d. Need to know who the bids were awarded to.

Thanks!d C

C

mpbelC<lsc@wddC

ureleywC<dwtiC

. bbg@vt>C<bveT>C,vg rTbtOC1 7w

From: Shona Campbell

Sent: Thursday, October 17, 2024 10:37 AM

To: Jacob Gilreath <jgilreath@woodburycountyiowa.gov>
Subject: RE: 2024-10-15 Board Items

For 11b and 11¢ who was the bid awarded to?

C

mpbelC<lsc@wddC

ureleywC<dwtlC

. bbg@vt>C<bveT>C,vg rTbtOC1T¥w

From: Jacob Gilreath <jgilreath@woodburycountyiowa.gov>
Sent: Thursday, October 17, 2024 8:56 AM




To: Shena Campbell <shcampbell@woodburycountyiowa.gov>
Subject: RE: 2024-10-15 Board Items

Shona,

Please see attached items 11b, 11c, and 11d. The Bid Tab starting with capital letters is for the PCC patching,
whereas the bid tab starting with lower case letters is for K19.

Thank you,

Jacob Gilreath

Woodbury County Secondary Roads
759 E Frontage Rd, Moville, 1A 51039
Office: (712) 873-3215

Cell: (712) 898-5602

From: Shona Campbell <shcampbeil@woodburycountyiowa.gov>

Sent: Thursday, October 17, 2024 8:08 AM

To: Mark Nahra <mnahra@woodburycountyiowa.gov>; Jacob Gilreath <jgilreath@woodburycountyiowa.gov>; Kyle
Gates <kgates@woodburycountyiowa.gov>; Laura Sievers <Isievers@woodburycountyiowa.gov>

Cc: Tish Brice <tbrice @woodburycountyiowa.gov>; Faye Hill <fhill@woodhurycountyiowa.gov>

Subject: 2024-10-15 Board ltems

Good morning,
Resolution #13,805 for the Bridge Embargo Resolution.

Would someone be able to provide the backup for the items below? Appreciate your help.

1la. Motion by Radig second by Bittinger to approve the resolution establishing weight limits on the listed county
bridges. Carried 5-0. Copy filed.

11b. Bid letting was held for PCC Patching. The bids are as follows:

Motion by Taylor second by Radig to receive bids for PCC Patching and return them to the county engineer far
review and recommendation. Carried 5-0. Copy filed.

1ic. Motion by Taylor second by Bittinger to award bid for PCC Patching if low quote if low bidder is found. Carried 5-0.
Copy filed.

i1d. Motion by Taylor second by Nelson to award bid for project number L-B{K15)—73-97. Carried 5-0. Copy filed.

Shona Campbell

Finance Clerk

Woodbury County Auditors Office

(712) 279-6702
shcampbell@woodburycountyiowa.gov




